
Bid No. 041321 

Asphalt Resurfacing and Repairs at Multiple School Sites 

Recap Sheet  

Section 1 – Nishimoto / Desmond 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Central Valley Asphalt - No bid - 

Anderson Striping $87,435.00 

Silicon Valley Paving  $91,000.00 

Cal Coating Asphalt $51,886.00 
* Pending Verification / Approval 

 

Section 2 - Madera South High School 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Central Valley Asphalt $162,600.00 

Anderson Striping $179,513.00 

Silicon Valley Paving  $131,000.00 

Cal Coating Asphalt $150,316.00 

*Pending Verification / Approval 

 

Section 3 – Child Nutrition 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Central Valley Asphalt - No Bid - 

Anderson Striping $97,366.00 

Silicon Valley Paving  $83,400.00 

Cal Coating Asphalt $69,981.00 
*Pending Verification / Approval 

 

Section 4 – Transportation  

Bidder Base Bid Amount 
 

Alt Bid Amount 

Central Valley Asphalt $870,200.00 $458,000.00 

Anderson Striping - No Bid - - No Bid - 

Silicon Valley Paving  $584,000.00 $346,000.00 

Cal Coating Asphalt $592,632.00 $306,686.00 
*Pending Verification / Approval 


